

UOBWA Chemical Bid Summary

2021 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

			BIDDER											
			AFC-Affinity		BMS-Brenntag		CCO-Carus		CCS-Colonial		CCU-Chemtrade		CSC-C&S	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	650,000	\$0.1295	\$84,175.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1775	\$115,375.00	\$0.1275	\$82,875.00
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	800,000		NO BID	\$0.0711	\$56,880.00		NO BID	\$0.0800	\$64,000.00		NO BID		NO BID
CHLORINE	Ton	95		NO BID	\$584.0000	\$55,480.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	105,000		NO BID	\$0.2110	\$22,155.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	105,000		NO BID	\$0.4780	\$50,190.00	\$0.3330	\$34,965.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	2,000		NO BID	\$17.5000	\$35,000.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID

			BIDDER											
			JCI-Jones		PCI-Pencco		SCC-Shannon		SWT-Sterling		TMB-Thornton		UUI-Univar	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	650,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	800,000	\$0.0807	\$64,560.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.0733	\$58,640.00
CHLORINE	Ton	95	\$479.0000	\$45,505.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	105,000		NO BID	\$0.2050	\$21,525.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1975	\$20,737.50
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	105,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.3410	\$35,805.00	\$0.3796	\$39,858.00	\$1.1000	\$115,500.00		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	2,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$10.8300	\$21,660.00	\$14.0000	\$28,000.00

AFC	Affinity Chemical, LLC	JCI	Jones Chemical, Inc.
BMS	Brenntag Mid-South	PCI	Pencco, Inc.
CCO	Carus Corporation	SCC	Shannon Chemical Corporation
CCS	Colonial Chemical Solutions, Inc.	SWT	Sterling Water Technologies LLC
CCU	Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	TMB	Thornton, Musso & Bellemin, Inc.
CSC	C&S Chemicals	UUI	Univar USA Inc.