

2020 BID TABULATION
Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

| | | | BIDDER | | | | | | | | | | | | |
|-----------------------|-----------|----------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-----------|----------------|-----------|-------------|
| | | | ADC - American | | AFC-Affinity | | BMS-Brenntag | | CCO-Carus | | CCU-Chemtrade | | CSC-C&S | | |
| CHEMICAL | UNIT | QUANTITY | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | |
| ALUMINUM SULFATE | Dry Pound | 620,000 | | NO BID | \$0.1285 | \$79,670.00 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | \$0.1630 | \$101,060.00 | \$0.1225 | \$75,950.00 |
| SODIUM HYDROXIDE | Wet Pound | 760,000 | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$0.0760 | \$57,760.00 | | NO BID | | | NO BID | \$0.0810 | \$61,560.00 |
| CHLORINE | Ton | 90 | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$548.0000 | \$49,320.00 | | NO BID | | | NO BID | | NO BID |
| HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID | Wet Pound | 100,000 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | | NO BID | | NO BID |
| PHOSPHATE | Wet Pound | 100,000 | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$0.5150 | \$51,500.00 | \$0.3270 | \$32,700.00 | | | NO BID | | NO BID |
| LIQUID ALGAECIDE | Gallon | 1,900 | \$17.0000 | \$32,300.00 | | NO BID | \$16.5900 | \$31,521.00 | | NO BID | | | NO BID | | NO BID |

| | | | BIDDER | | | | | | | | | |
|-----------------------|-----------|----------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|----------------|-------------|
| | | | JCI-Jones | | PCI-Pencco | | SCC-Shannon | | SWT-Sterling | | UUI-Univar | |
| CHEMICAL | UNIT | QUANTITY | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE | BID UNIT PRICE | BID PRICE |
| ALUMINUM SULFATE | Dry Pound | 620,000 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID |
| SODIUM HYDROXIDE | Wet Pound | 760,000 | \$0.0826 | \$62,776.00 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$0.0730 | \$55,480.00 |
| CHLORINE | Ton | 90 | \$505.0000 | \$45,450.00 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID |
| HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID | Wet Pound | 100,000 | | NO BID | \$0.1925 | \$19,250.00 | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$0.2000 | \$20,000.00 |
| PHOSPHATE | Wet Pound | 100,000 | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$0.3630 | \$36,300.00 | \$0.3840 | \$38,400.00 | | NO BID |
| LIQUID ALGAECIDE | Gallon | 1,900 | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | | NO BID | \$14.0000 | \$26,600.00 |

| | | | |
|-----|----------------------------------|-----|---------------------------------|
| ADC | American Development Corporation | JCI | Jones Chemical, Inc. |
| AFC | Affinity Chemical, LLC | PCI | Pencco, Inc. |
| BMS | Brenntag Mid-South | SCC | Shannon Chemical Corporation |
| CCO | Carus Corporation | SWT | Sterling Water Technologies LLC |
| CCU | Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC | UUI | Univar USA Inc. |
| CSC | C&S Chemicals | | |