

UOBWA Chemical Bid Summary

2023 BID TABULATION
 Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals
 Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority
 Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

			BIDDER													
			ACS-Aulick		AFC-Affinity		BMS-Brenntag		CCO-Carus		CCU-Chemtrade		CDR-Cedar Chem		CGO-CGO Technologies	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	730,000		NO BID	\$0.2130	\$155,490.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.2540	\$185,420.00		NO BID	\$0.2456	\$179,306.25
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	900,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1758	\$158,220.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
CHLORINE	Ton	65		NO BID		NO BID	\$2,395.0000	\$155,675.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	140,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	140,000	\$1.2200	\$170,800.00		NO BID	\$1.2200	\$170,800.00	\$1.2000	\$168,000.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	1,650		NO BID		NO BID	\$13.7200	\$22,638.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$14.7700	\$24,370.50		NO BID

			BIDDER											
			CSC-C&S Chemicals		JCI-Jones		PCI-Pencco		SCC-Shannon		SWT-Sterling		UUI-Univar	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	730,000	\$0.1990	\$145,270.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	900,000		NO BID	\$0.1925	\$173,250.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1723	\$155,070.00
CHLORINE	Ton	65		NO BID	\$2,240.0000	\$145,600.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	140,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.2510	\$35,140.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.2300	\$32,200.00
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	140,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$1.2700	\$177,800.00	\$0.9999	\$139,986.00		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	1,650		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$21.1682	\$34,927.53	\$16.7500	\$27,637.50

ACS	Aulick Chemical Solutions	CSC	C&S Chemicals
AFC	Affinity Chemical, LLC	JCI	Jones Chemical, Inc.
BMS	Brenntag Mid-South, Inc.	PCI	Pencco, Inc.
CCO	Carus LLC	SCC	Shannon Chemical Corporation
CCU	Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	SWT	Sterling Water Technologies LLC
CDR	Cedar Chem, LLC	UUI	Univar Solutions USA, Inc.
CGO	CGO Technologies		