

2022 BID TABULATION

Request For Bids - Water Treatment Chemicals

Upper Oconee Basin Water Authority

Bear Creek Reservoir and Water Treatment Facilities

			BIDDER											
			AFC-Affinity		BMS-Brenntag		CCO-Carus		CCU-Chemtrade		CSC-C&S		HWT-Hawkins	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	670,000	\$0.1795	\$120,265.00		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.2115	\$141,705.00	\$0.1645	\$110,215.00		NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	825,000		NO BID	\$0.1195	\$98,587.50		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
CHLORINE	Ton	100		NO BID	\$1,649.0000	\$164,900.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	110,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	110,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.6100	\$67,100.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	2,000		NO BID	\$11.9900	\$23,980.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$20.0000	\$40,000.00

			BIDDER											
			JCI-Jones		PCI-Pencco		SCC-Shannon		SWT-Sterling		TMB-Thornton		UUI-Univar	
CHEMICAL	UNIT	QUANTITY	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE	BID UNIT PRICE	BID PRICE
ALUMINUM SULFATE	Dry Pound	670,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
SODIUM HYDROXIDE	Wet Pound	825,000	\$0.1371	\$113,107.50		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.1210	\$99,825.00
CHLORINE	Ton	100	\$1,500.0000	\$150,000.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID
HYDROFLUOROSILIC ACID	Wet Pound	110,000		NO BID	\$0.2070	\$22,770.00		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.2100	\$23,100.00
PHOSPHATE	Wet Pound	110,000		NO BID		NO BID	\$0.7170	\$78,870.00	\$0.5766	\$63,426.00		NO BID		NO BID
LIQUID ALGAECIDE	Gallon	2,000		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	\$10.8300	\$21,660.00		NO BID

AFC	Affinity Chemical, LLC	JCI	Jones Chemical, Inc.
BMS	Brenntag Mid-South	PCI	Pencco, Inc.
CCO	Carus Corporation	SCC	Shannon Chemical Corporation
CCU	Chemtrade Chemicals US LLC	SWT	Sterling Water Technologies LLC
CSC	C&S Chemicals	TMB	Thornton, Musso & Bellemin, Inc.
HWT	Hawkins, Inc.	UUI	Univar USA Inc.